
BID 2023-07 ASPHALT MATERIALS
VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

Delivery Site: Price per Ton of Asphalt Delivered RK Hall Zack Burkett Unique

Pct. 1 Sherman Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 98.00 $136.40 No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 137.00 $156.40 $ 146.72
Plant Site in Miles <24 miles 138 mi 87 miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 14 tons 25 tons 23 tons

Pct. 2 Denison Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 97.00 $136.40 No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 137.00 $156.40 $ 148.26
Plant Site in Miles < 20 mi 138 mi 93 miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 14 tons 25 tons 23 tons

Pct. 3 Whitesboro Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 89.00 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 97.00 $129.80 No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 137.00 $149.80 $ 139.64
Plant Site in Miles < 20 mi 116 mi 67 miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 14 tons 25 tons 23 tons

Pct. 4 Pottsboro Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 97.00 $136.40 No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 137.00 $156.40 $145.80
Plant Site in Miles < 20 mi 138 mi 87 miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any)                                                                             
                                       

 14 tons 25 tons 23 tons

Pct. 4 Gordonville Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 88.00 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 98.00 $132.80 No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 139.00 $152.80 $143.64
Plant Site in Miles 28 miles 126 miles 78 miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 14 tons 25 tons 23 tons

FOB Plant Site
Hot Mix/Hot Lay $ 81.00 No Bid No Bid
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
Hot Mix/Cold Lay $ 90.00 $95.00 No Bid
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
High Performance Cold Mix $130.00 $115.00 $119.00
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
State Minimum Quantity (if any) No min No min 1 ton
Advance Notice for delivery ARO 24 hrs 48 hrs 48 hrs

Plant site:  Martin 
Marietta - 1795 
TX-101 
Bridgeport, TX 
76426
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