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CRS-2/CRS-2H 30,000 GALLONS $2.90
CRS-2/CRS-2H                      
substitue P2 CWE-2

30,000 GALLONS
NO BID               

$3.29 P2 CWE-2
CRS-2 30,000 GALLONS $2.727 CRS-2 30,000 GALLONS $2.96

CRS-2P 20,000 GALLONS $3.30 CRS-2P 20,000 GALLONS NO BID CRS-2P 20,000 GALLONS $3.127 CRS-2P 20,000 GALLONS $3.51

AE-P 40,000 GALLONS $3.60
AE-P                                    
substitute Prime Concentrate

40,000 GALLONS
NO BID                 

$2.24 PRIME 
CONENTRATE

AE-P                                  40,000 GALLONS NO BID AE-P                                  40,000 GALLONS $3.71

SS-1/SS-1H                             
substitute CSS-1/CSS-1H

30,000 GALLONS $2.95 CSS-1/CSS-1H
SS-1/SS-1H                    
substitute P2 S1

30,000 GALLONS
NO BID               

$2.96 P2 S1
SS-1/SS-1H                   30,000 GALLONS NO BID                        SS-1/SS-1H                   30,000 GALLONS $2.96

AES-300 30,000 GALLONS NO BID
AES-300                            
substitute P2 S1

30,000 GALLONS
NO BID               

$2.96 P2 S1
AES-300 30,000 GALLONS NO BID AES-300 30,000 GALLONS $3.76

MS 1 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 1 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 1 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 1 20,000 GALLONS $3.26

MS 2                                       
substitute CMS-2

20,000 GALLONS $3.00 CMS-2 MS 2 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 2 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 2 20,000 GALLONS $3.26

ROAD OILS 
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M.C. 30 15,000 GALLONS NO BID M.C. 30 15,000 GALLONS NO BID M.C. 30 15,000 GALLONS $4.50 M.C. 30 15,000 GALLONS $5.66

M.C. 250 5,000   GALLONS NO BID M.C. 250 5,000   GALLONS NO BID M.C. 250 5,000   GALLONS NO BID M.C. 250 5,000   GALLONS $5.26

M.C. 800 60,000 GALLONS NO BID M.C. 800 60,000 GALLONS NO BID
M.C. 800                                 
substitute MC 800TR

60,000 GALLONS $3.633 MC 800TR M.C. 800                                 60,000 GALLONS $5.26

M.C. 3000 20,000 GALLONS NO BID M.C. 3000 20,000 GALLONS NO BID
M.C. 3000                          
substitute MC 3000TR

20,000 GALLONS $3.733 MC 3000TR M.C. 3000                          20,000 GALLONS $5.26

A.C. 10 15,000 GALLONS $2.95 A.C. 10 15,000 GALLONS NO BID A.C. 10 15,000 GALLONS $3.38 A.C. 10 15,000 GALLONS $4.06

A.C. 5 5,000   GALLONS $3.05 A.C. 5 5,000   GALLONS NO BID A.C. 5 5,000   GALLONS $3.43 A.C. 5 5,000   GALLONS $4.06

Cleveland Asphalt 

MINIMUM LOAD:      5,000 GALLONS              

DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $90.00   (FIRST 2 HOURS NO CHARGE)  

ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY ARO:                  1 DAY 

 DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $80.00   (FIRST 2 HOURS NO 
CHARGE)

ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY:       1 - 3 DAYS 

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:        NONE
                                           NOT PROVIDED FOR HOT ASPHALT

MINIMUM LOAD:      5000 GALLONS, SMALLER QUANTITIES 
AVAILABLWE, PLEASE CALL FOR CHARGES 800-334-0177             

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:                        $90.00/LOAD

BID 2023-04 EMULSIONS
EFFECTIVE DATE:  03-01-2022 THROUGH 03-1-2023

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:                              
 $80.00/LOAD

DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $80.00   (FIRST 2 HOURS NO 
CHARGE)

ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY ARO:           
         2 DAYS 

 DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $100.00   (FIRST 2 HOURS NO 
CHARGE)

ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY:       1 DAY - 24 HOURS 

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:        $100/PER TRUCK PER 
LOAD
                                           NOT PROVIDED FOR HOT ASPHALT

P2 EMULSIONS 

MINIMUM LOAD:      WILL SHIP ANY QUANTITY BUT FREIGHT IS 
BASED ON FULL TRANSPOT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS              

MINIMUM LOAD:      FULL TRANSPORTS              



VENDOR:                     ERGON VENDOR:   WRIGHT ASPHALT

THIS BID IS FOR FULL TRANSPORT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS. 
FREIGHT IS BASED ON A FULL TRANSPORT LOAD, EVEN IF A 
FULL LOAD OF MATERIAL IS NOT ORDERED. RETURN FREIGHT IS 
ONE-HALF OF THE OUTGOING TARIFF. FOR EQUIPMENT 
ORDERED, BUT NOT USED, CARRIER MAY CHARGE UP TO
$400.00.

LOADS CANCELLED IN TRANSIT WILL BE BILLED AT COST.  
RETURNED LOADS WILL BE BILLED AN ADDITIONAL RETURN 
FREIGHT CHARGE OF $1,000.00.  RETURNED LOADS REQUIRE 
NOTOFICATION TO KODY KOHL (512) 517-5998

LAYOVER CHARGE:                                           $750.00 PER TRUCK PER 
NIGHT
CANCELLATION:                                                                                                          
LOADS TO BE DELIVERED ON MONDAY ------ CANCELLED BY 11 AM ON   
PRIOR SUNDAY                                                                                                            
LOADS TO BE DELIVERED DURING WEEK ----  CANCELLED BY 2PM 
PRIOR WORKDAY             


