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Vendor:

PMGR - 
NO BID

ITEM     MATERIAL CURRENT 
NO. LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED BID

CIRCULAR 
CULVERTS, 
HELICAL ENDS - 
PAINTED & 
GROUND.

1 12"       2 2/3" X 1/2"     16    2,500'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 18.00$        45,000.00$ 19.85$        49,625.00$    14.83$        37,075.00$ NO BID

ON ALL

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE ITEMS
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 45.00$        45.00$        30.77$        30.77$           22.25$        22.25$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 45.00$        45.00$        24.82$        24.82$           22.25$        22.25$        

2 15"       2 2/3" X 1/2"     16      800'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 21.60$        17,280.00$ 24.80$        19,840.00$    18.45$        14,760.00$ 

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 54.00$        54.00$        37.20$        37.20$           27.67$        27.67$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 54.00$        54.00$        31.07$        31.07$           27.67$        27.67$        

3 18"       2 2/3" X 1/2"    16    2,000'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 27.00$        54,000.00$ 30.27$        60,540.00$    22.10$        44,200.00$ 

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 67.50$        67.50$        45.39$        45.39$           33.15$        33.15$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 67.50$        67.50$        37.83$        37.83$           33.15$        33.15$        

4 24"       2 2/3" X 1/2"    16      800'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 34.20$        27,360.00$ 37.02$        29,616.00$    29.45$        23,560.00$ 

DESCRIPTION
DIAMETER  CORRUGATION

Texas Erosion Supply - 
Awarded Vendor

CURRENT BID

Wilson Culverts, Inc. - 
Awarded Vendor

CURRENT BIDCURRENT BID

Contech Engineered 
Solutions - Awarded 

Vendor
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b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 85.50$        85.50$        55.52$        55.52$           44.18$        44.18$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 85.50$        85.50$        46.27$        46.27$           44.18$        44.18$        

5 30"       2 2/3" X 1/2"      16      250'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 43.20$        10,800.00$ 48.99$        12,247.50$    36.89$        9,222.50$   

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 108.00$     108.00$      73.48$        73.48$           55.34$        55.34$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 108.00$     108.00$      61.23$        61.23$           55.34$        55.34$        

6 36"       2 2/3" X 1/2"      16      800'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 52.20$        41,760.00$ 57.95$        46,360.00$    44.63$        35,704.00$ 

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 130.50$     130.50$      86.93$        86.93$           66.94$        66.94$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 130.50$     130.50$      72.44$        72.44$           66.94$        66.94$        

7 48"       3" X 1"            12      800'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 68.40$        54,720.00$ 180.85$     144,680.00$  114.20$     91,360.00$ 

 * 5"x1"

b. STANDARD ONE PIECE 
ANNULAR BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 171.00$     171.00$      180.09$     180.09$         88.44$        88.44$        

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 171.00$     171.00$      180.09$     180.09$         88.44$        88.44$        

8 54 "           3" X 1"        12       250'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 174.30$     43,575.00$ 194.69$     48,672.50$    128.82$     32,205.00$ 

* 5"x1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 435.75$     435.75$      194.69$     194.69$         No Bid No Bid
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c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 435.75$     435.75$      194.69$     194.69$         199.03$     199.03$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece - 5"x1"
9 60"           3" X 1"        12      500'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 193.70$     96,600.00$ 218.17$     109,085.00$  140.97$     70,485.00$ 
* 5"x1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 483.00$     483.00$      218.17$     218.17$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 483.00$     483.00$      N/A N/A 221.34$     221.34$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece - 5"x1"
10 72 "           3" X 1"        10       50'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 231.00$     11,550.00$ 346.59$     17,329.50$    219.30$     10,965.00$ 
* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 577.50$     577.50$      346.59$     346.59$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 577.50$     577.50$      N/A N/A 267.76$     267.76$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece
11 84"           3" X 1"        10       25'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 268.80$     6,720.00$   370.18$     9,254.50$      257.76$     6,444.00$   
* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 672.00$     672.00$      370.18$     370.18$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 672.00$     672.00$      N/A N/A 309.58$     309.58$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece
12 96"           3" X 1"        10       25'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 308.70$     7,717.50$   454.65$     11,366.25$    292.32$     7,308.00$   
* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 771.75$     771.75$      454.65$     454.65$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 771.75$     771.75$      N/A N/A 353.86$     353.86$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece
13 108 "           3" X 1"        10      15'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 346.50$     5,197.50$   616.52$     9,247.80$      321.13$     4,816.95$   
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* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 866.25$     866.25$      616.52$     616.52$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 866.25$     866.25$      N/A N/A 398.27$     398.27$      

* Wide dimple 3 piece
14 120 "           3" X 1"        10       15'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 503.25$     7,548.75$   723.45$     10,851.75$    356.83$     5,352.45$   
* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 1,258.13$  1,258.13$   723.45$     723.45$         No Bid No Bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 1,258.13$  1,258.13$   N/A N/A 442.22$     442.22$      

* Wide dimple 3 piece

ITEM MATERIAL    PRICE PER    PRICE PER    PRICE PER
NO. DESCRIPTION LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED BID

SPAN x RISE CORRUGATION

PIPE ARCH CULVERTS
15 36"  Dia. 42X29  2 2/3 X 1/2"  16    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 62.35$        623.50$      65.82$        658.20$         No bid No bid NO BID
ON ALL

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE ITEMS
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 155.88$     155.88$      86.93$        86.93$           No bid No bid

16 42"  Dia. 49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   16    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 73.10$        731.00$      76.50$        765.00$         No bid No bid

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 182.75$     182.75$      101.33$     101.33$         No bid No bid

17 36"  Dia. 42X29  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 77.40$        774.00$      79.44$        794.40$         54.13$        541.30$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 193.50$     193.50$      86.93$        86.93$           66.94$        66.94$        

* Dimple band
18 42"  Dia. 49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 90.30$        903.00$      92.34$        923.40$         63.05$        630.50$      
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b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 225.75$     225.75$      101.33$     101.33$         77.39$        77.39$        

* Dimple band
19 48"  Dia. 57X38  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 103.20$     1,032.00$   105.34$     1,053.40$      86.12$        861.20$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 258.00$     258.00$      115.80$     115.80$         176.93$     176.93$      

* Wide dimple band
20 54"  Dia. 64X43  3" X 1"   14    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 146.40$     1,464.00$   118.32$     1,183.20$      97.30$        973.00$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 366.00$     366.00$      130.28$     130.28$         199.03$     199.03$      

* Wide dimple band
21 36"  Dia. 42X29  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 105.35$     1,053.50$   120.78$     1,207.80$      73.04$        730.40$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 263.38$     263.38$      86.93$        86.93$           66.94$        66.94$        

* Dimple band
22 42"  Dia. 49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 122.55$     1,225.50$   140.45$     1,404.50$      84.85$        848.50$      
 

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 306.38$     306.38$      101.33$     101.33$         77.39$        77.39$        

* Dimple band
23 48"  Dia. 57X38  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 139.75$     1,397.50$   160.19$     1,601.90$      115.70$     1,157.00$   

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 349.38$     349.38$      115.80$     115.80$         176.93$     176.93$      

* Wide dimple band
24 54"  Dia. 64X43  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 199.20$     1,992.00$   188.10$     1,881.00$      130.32$     1,303.20$   
* 3" x 1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 498.00$     498.00$      130.28$     130.28$         199.03$     199.03$      

* Wide dimple band
25 60"  Dia. 71X47  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 220.80$     2,208.00$   208.79$     2,087.90$      142.47$     1,424.70$   
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* 3" x 1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 552.00$     552.00$      144.75$     144.75$         221.34$     221.34$      

* Wide dimple band
ITEM MATERIAL    PRICE PER    PRICE PER    PRICE PER
NO. DESCRIPTION LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED BID

CIRCULAR 
CULVERTS, 
HELICAL ENDS, 
ALUMINIZED 
ASTM A 929
PIPE ARCH CULVERTS

26 36"   Dia. 42X29  2 2/3 X 1/2"  16    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 79.46$        7,946.00$   72..39 723.90$         No bid No bid NO BID

ON ALL

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE ITEMS
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 198.65$     198.65$      95.62$        95.62$           No bid No bid

27 42"  Dia. 49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   16    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 104.12$     1,041.20$   84.15$        841.50$         No bid No bid

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 260.30$     260.30$      111.45$     111.45$         No bid No bid

28 36"  Dia.  42X29  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 98.64$        9,864.00$   87.38$        873.80$         67.66$        676.60$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 246.60$     246.60$      95.62$        95.62$           83.68$        83.68$        

* Dimple band
29 42"  Dia.  49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 115.08$     1,150.80$   101.57$     1,015.70$      78.81$        788.10$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 287.70$     287.70$      111.45$     111.45$         96.74$        96.74$        

* Dimple band
30 48"  Dia.  57X38  2 2/3" X 1/2"   14    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 131.52$     1,315.20$   115.87$     1,158.70$      107.65$     1,076.50$   

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 328.80$     328.80$      115.80$     115.80$         221.16$     221.16$      

* Dimple band
31 54"  Dia. 64X43   2 2/3" X 1/2"   14     10'
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a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 167.14$     1,671.40$   130.34$     1,303.40$      121.63$     1,216.30$   
* 3" x 1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 417.85$     417.85$      143.30$     143.30$         248.79$     248.79$      

* Wide dimple band
32 36"  Dia.  42X29  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 134.26$     1,342.60$   132.85$     1,328.50$      91.30$        913.00$      

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 335.65$     335.65$      95.62$        95.62$           83.66$        83.66$        

* Dimple band
33 42"  Dia.  49X33  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 156.18$     1,561.80$   154.49$     1,544.90$      106.06$     1,060.60$   
 

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 390.45$     390.45$      111.45$     111.45$         96.74$        96.74$        

* Dimple band

ITEM MATERIAL    PRICE PER    PRICE PER    PRICE PER
NO. DESCRIPTION LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED LINEAR FT. EXTENDED BID

CIRCULAR 
CULVERTS, 
HELICAL ENDS, 
ALUMINIZED

34 48"Dia.57X38  2 2/3" X 1/2"   12    10'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 154.70$     1,547.00$   176.20$     1,762.00$      144.63$     1,446.30$   NO BID

ON ALL

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE ITEMS
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 386.75$     386.75$      115.80$     115.80$         221.16$     221.16$      

* Wide dimple band
35 54"   Dia.  64X43   2 2/3" X 1/2"   12     10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 197.54$     1,975.40$   206.90$     2,069.00$      162.90$     1,629.00$   
* 3" x 1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 493.85$     493.85$      143.30$     143.30$         248.79$     248.79$      

* Wide dimple band
36 60"   Dia.  71X47  2 2/3" X 1/2"    12     10'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 218.96$     2,189.60$   229.67$     2,296.70$      178.09$     1,780.90$   
* 3" x 1"

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 547.40$     547.40$      159.23$     159.23$         276.68$     276.68$      

* Wide dimple band
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37 84"           3" X 1"        10       25'
a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 304.64$     7,616.00$   407.19$     10,179.75$    322.20$     8,055.00$   

* 3" x 1"   12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 761.60$     761.60$      370.18$     370.18$         No bid No bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 761.60$     761.60$      N/A N/A 386.90$     386.90$      

* Wide dimple 2 piece  - 5"x1"
38 96"           3" X 1"        10       25'

a. SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 349.86$     8,746.50$   500.12$     12,503.00$    365.40$     9,135.00$   
* 12 Gauge

b. TWO PIECE RIVETED ANNULAR 
BAND(S) FOR ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 874.65$     874.65$      454.65$     454.65$         No bid No bid

c. ONE PIECE DIMPLE BAND(S) FOR 
ABOVE
SUGGESTED LIST PRICE $ 874.65$     874.65$      N/A N/A 442.33$     442.33$      

*
Min. order - free shipping Min. order - free shipping Min. order - free shipping
$2,500.00 $2,000.00 $0.00
Delivery Time Delivery Time Delivery Time 
3 weeks or less on 1-2 weeks on 16GA / 14 Days
 most material Heavier gages and Arch 

6-8 weeks

Wide dimple 2 piece  - 5"x1"
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