Delivery Site:

Price per Ton of Asphalt Delivered

Pct. 1 Sherman

Hot Mix/Hot Lay

Hot Mix/Cold Lay

High Performance Cold Mix
Plant Site in Miles

State Minimum Quantity (if any)

Pct. 2 Denison

Hot Mix/Hot Lay

Hot Mix/Cold Lay

High Performance Cold Mix
Plant Site in Miles

State Minimum Quantity (if any)

Pct. 3 Whitesboro

Hot Mix/Hot Lay

Hot Mix/Cold Lay

High Performance Cold Mix
Plant Site in Miles

State Minimum Quantity (if any)

Pct. 4 Pottsboro

Hot Mix/Hot Lay

Hot Mix/Cold Lay

High Performance Cold Mix
Plant Site in Miles

State Minimum Quantity (if any)

Pct. 4 Gordonville

Hot Mix/Hot Lay

Hot Mix/Cold Lay

High Performance Cold Mix
Plant Site in Miles

State Minimum Quantity (if any)
FREIGHT ON BOARD - Plant Site
Hot Mix/Hot Lay

FOB County Truck, Your Yard
Hot Mix/Cold Lay

FOB County Truck, Your Yard
High Performance Cold Mix
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
State Minimum Quantity (if any)

Advance Notice for delivery ARO

BID TABULATION 2024-04 ASPHALT MATERIALS

Zack Burkett - 2024

Vulcan Materials - 2024 Missouri Petroleum

Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$133.65 $173.89 No Bid
$153.65 $221.89 No Bid
138 mi 443 miles
25 tons 24 tons
No Bid No Bid
$133.65 175.2%7
$153.65 $223.27 No Bid
138 mi 449 miles
25 tons 24 tons
No Bid No Bid
$127.50 $176.65
$147.50 $ 224.65 No Bid
116 mi 455 miles
25 tons 24 tons
No Bid No Bid
$133.65 $176.19
$153.65 $224.19 No Bid
138 mi 453 miles
25 tons 24 tons
No Bid No Bid
$130.25 $180.10 No Bid
$150.25 $228.10 No Bid
126 miles 470 miles
25 tons 24 tons
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$95.00 $72.00 No Bid
$115.00 $120.00 No Bid
No min 24 tons OPTION - Surface
Preservation
Treatment - $2.91 for
50,000 square yards -
Traffic Control
$4,000.00
24 hrs



	Table 1

