
 2026-03 ASPHALT MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

Delivery Site: Price per Ton of Asphalt Delivered Reynolds Asphalt & 
Construction RK Hall, LLC Hall Brothers, Inc. Vulcan Construction 

Materials, LLC
Zack Burkett 

Company Austin Asphalt

Pct. 1 - Hot Mix/Hot Lay $109.75 $91.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00
Sherman Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $103.00 No Bid  $175.89 (LRA Item 330) $134.65 No Bid

High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $143.00 $161.08 $221.89 $153.65 $159.00
Plant Site in Miles 25 Miles (Anna Plant) <20 MILES 87 Miles 443 Miles 135 Miles 30 Miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 12 Tons 25 Tons 24 Tons 25 Tons 22 Tons

Pct. 2 - Hot Mix/Hot Lay $110.25 $91.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $97.00
Denison Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $103.00 No Bid  $177.27 (LRA Item 330) $134.65 No Bid

High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $143.00 $161.08 $223.27 $153.65 $161.00
Plant Site in Miles 25 Miles (Anna Plant) <20 MILES 87 Miles 449 Miles 138 Miles 39 Miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 12 Tons 25 Tons 24 Tons 25 Tons 22 Tons

Pct. 3 - Hot Mix/Hot Lay $113.25 $91.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $97.00
Whitesboro Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $103.00 No Bid $178.65 (LRA Item 330) $128.50 No Bid

High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $143.00 $153.49 $224.65 $147.50 $161.00
Plant Site in Miles 44 Miles (Anna Plant) <24 MILES 64 Miles 455 Miles 116 Miles 36 Miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 12 Tons 25 Tons 24 Tons 25 Tons 22 Tons

Pct. 4 - Hot Mix/Hot Lay $111.75 $91.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00
Pottsboro Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $103.00 No Bid $178.19 (LRA Item 330) $134.65 No Bid

High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $143.00 $159.76 $224.19 $153.65 $163.00
Plant Site in Miles 36 Miles (Anna Plant) 83 Miles 453 Miles 138 Miles 46 Miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any)         12 Tons 25 Tons 24 Tons 25 Tons 22 Tons

Pct. 4 - Hot Mix/Hot Lay $114.75 $92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.00
Gordonville Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $104.00 No Bid $182.10  (LRA Item 330) $131.25 No Bid

High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $144.00 $156.79 $228.10 $150.25 $163.00
Plant Site in Miles 52 Miles (Anna Plant) 28 MILES 74 Miles 470 Miles 126 Miles 48 Miles
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 12 Tons 25 Tons 24 Tons 25 Tons 22 Tons

Hot Mix/Hot Lay $96.75 $83.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.00
Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid $95.00 No Bid $74.00 $96.00 $140.00 
High Performance Cold Mix No Bid $135.00 $125.00 $120.00 $115.00 No Bid
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 12 Tons No min No min 24 Tons
Advance Notice Needed 1 day Morning of pickup 24 Hours 7 days

Anna plant moving to 
Dorchester site in June 

2026.

Plant Location:  7051 S 
FM51, Paradise, TX  

76073

LRA Item 330 = TxDOT 
specification for Limestone 

Rock Asphalt Pavement

Cooperative Participation -
Yes

Cooperative 
Participation - Yes

Cooperative Participation -
Yes

Cooperative Participation - 
Yes

Pickup From 
Plant Location

Miscellaneous notes:


