
Bid No. 2026-02 AGGREGATE MATERIALS BID TABULATION

P&K Stone Amrize Big City Crushed 
Concrete Vulcan Materials Tri County Materials North Texas Natural 

Select Materials Dolese

1 NO. 1 BASE - TYPE A

$11.50 - Coleman

 $9.50 - (Spec. 1" 
County Blend - 

Colemant Plant) No Bid

 Pct.1 - $49.63 
Pct. 2 - $52.10 
Pct. 3 - $39.86 

Pct. 4 - Denison - $52.11 
Pct. 4 - Gordonville - $48.65 $9.75 $11.00 $13.50

2 NO. 2 BASE - TYPE A
$11.50 - Coleman

 $9.50 - (Spec. 1" 
County Blend - 

Colemant Plant) No Bid No Bid $9.75 $11.00 No Bid

3 CRUSHER RUN  1"

No Bid No Bid No Bid

 Pct.1 - $33.66 
Pct. 2 - $33.44 
Pct. 3 - $29.27 

Pct. 4 - Denison - $32.69 
Pct. 4 - Gordonville - $23.35 $9.75 No Bid $12.30

4 CRUSHER RUN  1.5"
$11.50 - Coleman

 $9.50 - (Spec. 1" 
County Blend - 

Colemant Plant) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.75
5 5/8" GRANITE CHIPS $22.00 - Mill Creek No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 3/8" GRANITE CHIPS $22.00 - Mill Creek No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 3/8" WASHED LIMESTONE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 5/8" WASHED LIMESTONE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 DECOMPOSED GRANITE,      
PIT RUN $10.00 - Mill Creek No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid

10 5/8" DECOMPOSED GRANITE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid
11 3"x 5" OVERSIZED ROCK $16.00 - Coleman No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.00 $13.00 No Bid

 1" County Blend - 
$9.50 - Pickup at 

Coleman, OK 
*All prices FOB 

 Crushed Asphalt/Cold 
Mix 

1" minus - $15.00 
TxDOT Item 247, 

Grade 1 &2, Recycle Flex 
Base - $16.00 

 Decomposed Granite: 
3064 S. Prairie, 

Tishomingo, OK 
Limestone Material 

(Base and 3x5): 
from N3760 Rd - E 1962 

Rd., Kenefic, OK 

 1.5" Crusher Run - $12.65 
FOB: Ardmore Quarry 

 797 TX-11, Sherman, TX 
75090 Plant  *All prices 

FOB only. 
*Quantities not 

 Pick-up Only 
15256 FM 1201, 

Gainsville, TX  76240 
  164 Dolese Road, 

Ardmore, OK  73401 

Cooperative Participation - 
Yes

Cooperative 
Participation - No

Cooperative Participation -
Yes

Cooperative Participation - 
Yes

Cooperative 
Participation - No

Cooperative 
Participation - Yes

Cooperative Participation - 
No

*all pricing reflects per ton costs

1


