
BID 2025-04 EMULSIONS 

VENDOR:                                                                                                                                                                                                                                            VENDOR:   

EMULSIONS 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY UNIT PRICE/GALLON EMULSIONS 

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY UNIT PRICE/GALLON

CRS-2/CRS-2H 30,000 GALLONS $2.47 CRS-2 30,000 
GALLONS $2.735

CRS-2P 20,000 GALLONS $2.97 CRS-2P 20,000 
GALLONS NO BID

AE-P 40,000 GALLONS $3.42 AE-P                                  40,000 
GALLONS NO BID

SS-1/SS-1H                           
substitute CSS-1H 30,000 GALLONS $2.67 SS-1/SS-1H           

substitute CSS-1H        
30,000 

GALLONS 2.735

AES-300 30,000 GALLONS NO BID AES-300 30,000 
GALLONS NO BID

MS 1 20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 1 20,000 
GALLONS NO BID

MS 2                                    20,000 GALLONS NO BID MS 2 20,000 
GALLONS NO BID

ROAD OILS 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY UNIT PRICE/GALLON ROAD OILS 

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY UNIT PRICE/GALLON

M.C. 30 15,000 GALLONS NO BID M.C. 30 15,000 
GALLONS $4.108

M.C. 250 5,000   GALLONS NO BID M.C. 250 5,000   
GALLONS NO BID

M.C. 800 60,000 GALLONS NO BID
M.C. 800                                      
substitute MC 
800TR

60,000 
GALLONS NO BID

M.C. 3000 20,000 GALLONS NO BID
M.C. 3000                          
substitute MC 
3000TR

20,000 
GALLONS NO BID

A.C. 10 15,000 GALLONS $2.67 A.C. 10 15,000 
GALLONS  NO BID

A.C. 5 5,000   GALLONS $2.77 A.C. 5 5,000   
GALLONS NO BID

ERGON 

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:                      $100.00/LOAD

WRIGHT ASPHALT

DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $100.00                          
(FIRST 2 HOURS NO CHARGE)
ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY:                       
1 DAY - 24 HOURS 

PUMP CHARGES FOR TANK DELIVERY:                                
$100/PER TRUCK PER LOAD

MINIMUM LOAD:  WILL SHIP ANY QUANTITY BUT FREIGHT IS 
BASED ON FULL TRANSPOT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS              

MINIMUM LOAD:  FULL TRANSPORTS - 5,500 GALLONS        

DEMURRAGE CHARGE PER HOUR:  $100.00                                   
(FIRST 2 HOURS NO CHARGE)                       
ADVANCE NOTICE NEEDED FOR DELIVERY ARO:                   
  1 DAY 

LESS THAN FULL LOAD MAY BE ORDERED, HOWEVER, DELIVERY 
FREIGHT WILL BE BASED ON A FULL TRANSPORT LOAD OF 5,500 
GALLONS.  BASED ON THE FREIGHT OF $0.22/GALLON, A 
TRANSPORT WOULD BE $1,210.00 PLUS THE COST OF MATERIAL.  
RETURN FREIGHT IS CHARGED AT ONE-HALF OF THE COMMON 
CARRIER'S CURRENT OUTGOING TARRIFF.  **FEDERAL 
ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED TO THE ABOVE PRICES AT 
A RATE OF $0.49770/TON FOR ASPHALT AND POLYMER LOADS OR 
$0.00150/GALLON FOR EMULSION LOADS.

LOADS CANCELLED IN TRANSIT WILL BE BILLED AT COST.  
RETURNED LOADS WILL BE BILLED AN ADDITIONAL 
RETURN FREIGHT CHARGE OF $1,200.00.  LAYOVER CHARGE 
$750.00 RETURNED LOADS REQUIRE NOTOFICATION TO 
KODY KOHL (512) 517-5998 DISPATCH - ALYSSA CASIANO 
713-574-0744 OR ORDERS@WRIGHTASPHALT.COM

LAYOVER CHARGE:                                                               $750.00 
PER TRUCK PER NIGHT
CANCELLATION:                                                                                                                                    
** LOADS TO BE DELIVERED ON MONDAY -                                                 
CANCELLED BY 11 AM ON  PRIOR SUNDAY                                                                                           
** LOADS TO BE DELIVERED DURING WEEK  -  CANCELLED 
BY 2PM PRIOR WORKDAY             


	Table 1

