
BID TABULATION 2025-03 ASPHALT MATERIALS

Delivery Site: Price per Ton of Asphalt Delivered

BLADES GROUP, LLC - 3 FM 
1403, UVALDE, tx  78801 - 

ROWDY CHEATHAM - 833-568-
6001 *8258

RK - HALL, LLC, 6630 FM 120, 
DENISON, TX  75020 - LANDON 

DAVIS - 903-715-5211 

SUSTAINABLE PAVEMENT 
TECHNOLOGIES - 6301 

GASTON AVE., SUITE 1236, 
DALLAS, TX  75214 - JOHN 

COLLINS - 860-970-7159

BIG CITY CRUSHED 
CONCRETE - PO BOX 29816, 
DALLAS, TX  75229 - STEVE 

STUTLER - 972-243-5820

Pct. 1 Sherman Hot Mix/Hot Lay  $                                              90.50 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay  $                                            102.50 No Bid No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 265.12 142.50$                                             No Bid No Bid
Plant Site in Miles 459 MILES <20 MILES
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 1 FULL TRUCK 14 ton

Pct. 2 Denison Hot Mix/Hot Lay  $                                              90.50 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay  $                                            102.50 No Bid No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 267.28 142.50$                                             No Bid No Bid
Plant Site in Miles 466 MILES <20 MILES
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 1 FULL TRUCK 14 ton

Pct. 3 Whitesboro Hot Mix/Hot Lay  $                                              90.50 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay  $                                            102.50 No Bid No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 267.59 142.50$                                             No Bid No Bid
Plant Site in Miles 467 MILES <24 MILES
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 1 FULL TRUCK 14 ton

Pct. 4 Pottsboro Hot Mix/Hot Lay  $                                              90.50 No Bid No Bid
Hot Mix/Cold Lay  $                                            102.50 No Bid No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 268.21  $                                            142.50 No Bid No Bid
Plant Site in Miles 469 MILES <10 MILES
State Minimum Quantity (if any)                                                                             
                                       

1 FULL TRUCK 14 ton
Pct. 4 Gordonville Hot Mix/Hot Lay  $                                              91.50 No Bid No Bid

Hot Mix/Cold Lay  $                                            103.50 No Bid No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix $ 268.52 143.50$                                             No Bid No Bid
Plant Site in Miles 470 MILES 28 MILES
State Minimum Quantity (if any) 1 FULL TRUCK
FREIGHT ON BOARD - Plant 
Hot Mix/Hot Lay No Bid  $                                              83.00 No Bid No Bid
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
Hot Mix/Cold Lay No Bid  $                                              95.00 No Bid No Bid
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
High Performance Cold Mix No Bid 135.00$                                             No Bid No Bid
FOB County Truck, Your Yard
State Minimum Quantity (if any) No min
Advance Notice for delivery ARO

24 hrs
NATURAL ROCK ASPHALT 

POTHOLE REPAIR - $20.00 PER 
BAG / $1,240.00 PER PALLET - 1 
PALLET MINIMUM - 50LB BAGS                                                                                         

$526.00 PER TOTE - 3 
SUPERSACK MINIMUM OR 1 

PALLET & 1 SUPERSACK 

RECYCLED COLD MIX, COLD 
LAY - $90.00 PER TON - 11143 
GOODNIGHT LAND, DALLAS, 

TX  75229                                                                     
Pugmill Mixing (On Site)  AT 
COUNTY LOCATION, WITH 

COUNTY MILLINGS

CRUSHED ASPHALT/COLD 
MIX - 1" MINUS - $15.00 PER 

TON - PLANT SITE - 797 TX-11, 
SHERMAN, TX  75090                              

ALL PRICES FOB ONLY      
QUANTITIES NOT 

GUARANTEED
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